[TO BE PUBLISHED IN THE GAZETTE OF INDIA, EXTRAORDINARY, PART II,
SECTION 3, SUB-SECTION (1)]
Government of India
Ministry of Corporate Affairs
Notification
ot

New Delhi, dated, the _ 29  June, 2016
GS.R. ___ (E). - In exercise of the powers conferred by sections 73 and 76 read with sub-
section (1) of section 469 of the Companies Act, 2013 (18 of 2013), the Central
Government hereby makes the fol lowing rules further to amend the Companies

(Acceptance of Deposits) Rules, 2014, namely:- (1) These rules may be called the

Companies (Acceptance of Deposits) Amendment Rules, 2016.
(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazette.

2. In the Companies (Acceptance of Deposits) Rules, 2014 (hereinafter referred to as the

principal rules), in rule 2, in sub-rule (1), in clause (c),-

(i) in sub-clause (ix), for the words “five years” the words “ten years” shall be

substituted;
(ii) after sub-clause (ix), the following sub-clause shall be inserted, namely,-

“(ixa) any amount raised by issue of non-convertible debenture not constituting a
charge on the assets of the company and listed on a recognised stock exchange as per

applicable regulations made by Securities and Exchange Board of India.”;

(iii) for sub-clause (xi), the following sub-clause shall be substituted, namely:-




“(xi) any non-interest bearing amount received and held in trust;”;
(iv) in sub-clause (xii),-

(A) after item (d) and before the proviso, the following items shall be inserted,

namely:-

“(e) as an advance towards consideration for providing future services
in the form of a warranty or maintenance contract as per written agreement or
arrangement, if the period for providing such services does not exceed the period
prevalent as per common business practice or five years, from the date of

acceptance of such service whichever is less;

(f) as an advance received and as allowed by any sectoral regulator

or in accordance with directions of Central or State Government;

(g) as an advance for subscription towards publication, whether in
print or in electronic to be adjusted against receipt of such publications; ”.

(B) in the Explanation, the words “referred to in the proviso” shall be omitted;

(v) in the Explanation, after sub-clause (xiv), for the words “shall be treated as
deposits”, the words “shall be considered as deposits unless specifically excluded under
this clause” shall be substituted;

(vi) after sub-clause (xiv), the following sub-clauses shall be inserted, namely:-

(xv) any amount received by way of subscription in respect of a chit under

the Chit Fund Act, 1982 (40 of 1982);
2




(xvi) any amount received by the company under any collective investment
scheme in compliance with regulations framed by the Securities and
Exchange Board of India;

(xvii) an amount of twenty five lakh rupees or more received by a start-up
company, by way of a convertible note (convertible into equity shares or
repayable within a period not exceeding five years from the date of issue) in

a single tranche, from a person.

Explanation.- For the purposes of this sub-clause,-

L. “start-up company” means a private company incorporated under the
Companies Act, 2013 or Companies Act, 1956 and recognised as such in accordance
with notification number G.S.R. 180(E) dated 17t February, 2016 issued by the

Department of Industrial Policy and Promotion, Ministry of Commerce and Industry;

[I. “convertible note” means an instrument evidencing receipt of money initially as a
debt, which is repayable at the option of the holder, or which is convertible into such
number of equity shares of the start-up company upon occurrence of specified events

and as per the other terms and conditions agreed to and indicated in the instrument.

(xviii) any amount received by a company from Alternate Investment Funds,
Domestic Venture Capital Funds and Mutual Funds registered with the Securities and

Exchange Board of India in accordance with regulations made by it.”.

3. In Rule 3 of the Principal rules,-




(i) in sub-rule (3),-

(a) for the words “twenty five per cent.”, the words “thirty five per cent.”

shall be substituted:
(b) the following proviso shall be inserted namely:

“Provided that a private company may accept from its members monies
not exceeding one hundred per cent of aggregate of the paid up share
capital, free reserves and securities premium account and such company
shall file the details of monies so accepted to the Registrar in such manner

as may be specified.”.

(ii) for sub-rule (8), the following sub-rule shall be substituted, namely:-

“(8)-- (a) Every eligible company shall obtain, at least once in a year, credit
rating for deposits accepted by it and a copy of the rating shall be sent to the

Registrar of Companies alongwith the return of deposits in Form DPT-3.

(b) The credit rating referred to in clause (a) shall not be below the minimum
investment grade rating or other specified credit rating for fixed deposits, from
any one of the approved credit rating agencies as specified for Non-Banking
Financial Companies in the Non-Banking Financial Companies Acceptance of
Public Deposits (Reserve Bank) Directions, 1998, issued by the Reserve Bank of

India, as amended from time to time.”




4. in rule 4 of the principal rules, for sub-rule (2), the following sub-rule shall be

substituted, namely:-

“ (2) Every eligible company intending to invite deposits shall issue a circular in
the form of an advertisement in form DPT-1 for the purpose in English language
in an English newspaper having country wide circulation and in vernacular
language in a vernacular newspaper having wide circulation in the State in which
the registered office of the company is situated, and shall also place such circular
on the website of the company, if any.”.
5.in rule 5 of the principal rules, in sub-rule (1), for the proviso, the following proviso
shall be substituted, namely:-
“Provided that the companies may accept deposits without deposit insurance
contract till the 31t March, 2017 or till the availability of a deposit insurance

product, whichever is earlier.”.

6. after rule 16 of the principal rules, the following rule shall be inserted, namely:-
“16A. Disclosures in the financial statement.- (1) Every company, other than a
private company, shall disclose in its financial statement, by way of notes, about

the money received from the director.
(2) Every private company shall disclose in its financial statement, by way of
notes, about the money received from the directors, or relatives of directors.”.

7. in the principal rules, in the Annexure, in Form DPT-1, the following para shall be

inserted, namely:-




“6. DISCLAIMER - It is to be distinctly understood that filing of circular or
circular in the Form of advertisement with the Registrar should not in any way
be deemed or construed that the same has been cleared or approved by the
Registrar or Central Government. The Registrar or Central Government does not
take any responsibility either for the financial soundness of any deposit scheme
for which the deposit is being accepted or invited or for the correctness of the
statements made or opinions expressed in the circular or circular in the Form of
advertisement. The depositors should exercise due diligence before investing in
the deposits schemes.” .

[File No 1/8/2013-CL-V]

Do nf i
s 29 [ec _.-;.J(. [ 6
/ (Amardeep Smghfiihatia)

' /7 Joint Secretary to the Government of India

Note. - The principal rules were published in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, Part
[, Section 3, sub-section (i) vide number G.S.R. 256(E), dated the 315t March, 2014 and
subsequently amended vide number G.S.R. 386(E), dated the 6% June, 2014, GS.R.

241(E), dated the 315t March, 2015 and G.S.R. 695(E), dated the 15t September, 2015.




[(HRE FT TSI, FWYURT, HET-2, G3-3, 39T (i) & Taprermd]
R THR
FRUNT FE FHATerT
ity

7% feeeh, ali 29 =, 2016

WHLFA ... (3).- T WHR, F9 0T, 2013 (2013 =1 18) Hir &wT 469
aﬁrsqamu)%mzrwfa?rﬂm?smummmmamwmmm
m:ﬁam@r@hmﬁnﬁmﬂzomwmmmm%ﬁwﬁmﬁﬁaﬁm
g 8, AU - 1)sﬁﬁuﬁwmmaqﬁ(mﬁm)mﬂmm,
2016 &1

(2) ¥ 7 TS # v B adE F yged g

2. HYA (STET Hr TPRA) Faw, 2014(%@%@%%%@@%
& fAgw 2 & 3ufags (1) & @3 () &, -

() 39@s (x) # 97 a¥ 9eaf & AT W aF a9 eg, T FATTN;
(i) 3983 (ix) & geaq FFfaf@d 3u@s w@r s, Y-

(|xmmxmﬁamwgmﬁaaﬁ@ﬁmﬁmﬂﬂ?hwuﬁmﬁ3ﬁr
ﬁﬁmraﬁéaamamvmamﬁﬁmﬁ%mﬁnﬁwwm
memmmmﬂmmﬁﬁéuﬁl

(iii) 3@ (xi) & T W FAe=faf@a 3u@s w@@r s, -
“(xi) =T # gred AR W@ 9 B surer WA ui
(iv) 39@E (xii) #,
(37) & () F 991 I 9{dh & g P #7g 3a-Ed fhe siger, -

(3)%mmwm%m¢mmmwmmwaﬁa
& T A 3G A F AU R 307 & w0 & IR odr Jar 399y
W F AT 3afd & dar A wpfa H adw ¥ TEET FRER TaEwR F
HTER Fafed 3afer 3rar uig af & 3#f®e 747 &), ot o & ar

() el i RS g@r/T 7o 3 JrEr FE WHER AT Tod AR
& ARt & par AR 3F F w9 F e

1




(a)mma;ﬁ’rcmmaama?mﬁ qTe AZUT AT FoaeAE, o
ﬂﬁmm@rmﬁr*%@mﬁmm%r

(3m) et Fasdieor #, oiqw & weflar et @1 o R smoe)

(v) 39WS (xiv) & TRANT 3 AT TASEFOT &, “Ft STHT HEAT ST Gl &
ﬁv'wmmmaaamﬁawmga?mﬁﬂﬁﬁmmﬁsﬁm
STel AT AT g Qe TW AT

(vi) 39EE (xiv) & geard PR 3uds sia-enfa e s, Y-

“(wv) Frehe aftifaae, 1982 (1982 &1 40) ¥ 3reher frelt fre & wayr & sierEmer
& ATCTH A UIST H1E T

(xw)ﬂﬂ?ﬁﬂﬂﬁﬁ?ﬁﬁﬁﬁﬁﬂﬁéﬂﬂ%ﬂﬁﬁﬁﬂﬁ%ﬁﬂwﬁm
W%TW%WMWWmHﬁT

(xvii) Tl cafed @ Fufadeia Roqor & smeaw @ (@ R F FoRada
mmﬁsﬁﬁﬁmﬂa#waﬁ#mﬁmmﬁ%sﬁmmﬁ?ﬁmm
wﬁmmmwamﬁ?rémmmmmmﬁm
afar|

TASEOT: $H 39WS & YA & Qv -

L AT FUAr § Fodr 3OHaa, 2013 yar Husit 3fQATH, 1956 & ey
fFfaa Ak e A ik date R aifisa AR 3T FAeT ganT IRy
HOFEAT HEAT WLHLFA. 180(31) ad@ 17 wwad, 2016 & 3ITER 30 §T F #A=gar
UIed H1$ gI5de Huer HEvT

1. FIRadeT Roqor & yRffie v w KT & &0 F B TR H @ w7 Had
AU & S URSF & RAdcT & IqER TR ¥ srear AR geanit F 8y w
RT&WW*W%W%W#@T%W%W%@H:%W?
MR i v 3 Tevat 3R et & R waRadstar )

(xvm)Wﬁﬂﬁ&ﬁTﬁ'ﬁWﬁﬁﬁWWWﬁﬁﬁﬁ*W&ﬁ?
3G 9 ST dfeusn Raer @A, aeﬁmmmwmﬁ%a
et Suelr Fr grog A Tl

3. Ao 7 aw & e 3 #,

(i) 3ufamer (3) #,




(®) ool gfdera ersel & e woFdha giea Use TW TG,
(@) i@ was sia-vafa fmr smeem, srefg-

Wﬁéw@zmmm@mmamsﬁ A @eT 3R
Wﬁmm*w%ammmﬁmmmw
m%aﬁrmmwwmnﬁméuﬁrﬁwﬁwﬁﬁﬁw
I & R A wEer w7

(ii)WB*WWWWWW,W-

“(8).- (m)mwmﬁ#mﬁwwmmmmm
Www&%ﬁtmwmmmmﬁwaﬁm
SIICI-3 & St #r faawol & @y doeh foRer # Sl soe

(@ s ( mﬁﬁhmwmm&hmmmm
mwwmﬁiﬁamaﬁﬁﬁwmmmﬁﬁwﬁ
(Reed d9) @2, 1998ﬁma‘mﬁﬁmma§mwﬁﬁﬁw
mwmmmmﬁﬁwmﬁﬁmmﬁmr
mmmmﬁﬁﬁqﬁﬁzﬁ%ﬂﬁ;ﬁ?}waﬁmﬂmt

4.@%%%4%%(2)%%%ﬁmﬁ%mwm,
3rATa-

"(2)mamﬁﬁmﬁ$ﬁ¢manﬁﬁmmmea?ﬁm
mma1ﬁﬁmqﬂavmﬂwqmtﬁaarﬁqﬁmaﬂmﬁﬁﬁ
AT FATEAR-9T F 3D sy o IR F9er & P FrRfeT awr T
#Wmmmmﬁwﬁwmmﬁﬁmm
Eﬁrmﬁmﬁmaﬁtﬁﬁqﬁwaﬁm%m,aﬁmawsﬁ
ece (i

5 mﬁawé:ﬁmnsa;mﬁan(nﬁwﬁwwﬁmﬁ@ﬁmw
SITQaT, 372Td-

W FUfAAT 31 A, 2017 & 3ryar Ty S diemr 3cure @ 3qesydar g,
St o gger g, fae srar der w@fder & ser ® R T gwdr

s,ngrﬁawéﬁﬁmwa:qamaﬁmﬁf@awﬁuwﬁazﬁnm%mm,
HUTT-




“163. el fawor # wwdawor- (1) yds @, ot wigae Foel & e,
ﬁwmmﬁmﬁwﬁﬁmmﬁ#maﬂwmmm

(z)mmmmmmﬁmmﬁmmmmm
& waftat & urea e 1 gwdaIor F”

7.@W$mﬁmm-1$%ﬁﬁmﬁﬁaﬁvmzwﬁaﬁm

“6. TIEICART.- IF FISC ®9 F FASN A0 & TR F 99 IRGT 3447 g
&mﬁqﬁwmmﬁaﬁamm%ﬁmmﬁw
PR ZART HEIPIA 3r0ar Fepest Rar aram &1 WOReR Irmar S8 w4y
mmmwﬁﬁmgm%m,mﬁummmmmﬁaaﬁ
ﬁ%m%mﬁm%mﬁqﬁwﬁﬁummﬁmmﬁ
mﬁmaﬂémﬂﬁ%lmmﬁﬁﬁﬁﬁawmﬁqﬁw
qddhdr sl

[T.4.1/8/2013-H1Ta-v)

\ &
\(l‘m
L‘M |

(3R g st
WgFd wfEE, ST WER

feeaofl. - Ao e aRa & oI, IWURYT, s, @s3, 3uEs () # @
256(31) aI@ 31 AW, 2014 @Rt YR fhar @ or 3K arer ey 386(31) arra
06 ST, 2014, Ar.#LiA.dEar 241(31) arfr@ 31 A, 2015 31K @TFIaT 695(37) ardr™
15 RAdeR, 2015 2@RT 6 are & Feesr e are o




